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Report

l't Reunioh held on 13.0!.2OLg

Under the initiative of IQAC the Alumni Association of Durgapur Women's College had been

formed on L5.L2.2OL9. Accordingly it was decided that the portfolio holders of the

association would make earnest effort to disseminate this information among the Ex-

students and increase the membership as early as possible. lt was also resolved in the

meeting that a Reunion would be held on l-3.01 .2019.

Within a short period, our ex-students very successfully organized the celebration. With

remarkable enthusiasm and due sincerity they celebrated their L't reunion in their Alma

Mater. Approximately 50 students joined the celebration on that date. We were

overwhelmed to find our students, who had their graduation even in the 80s or early 90s, to

come and participate in the programme. Some of them came from Kolkata, while one of

them joined coming from Sikkim. This undoubtedly spelt their feeling for their college.

Of these students some are now housewives contributing a lot to the society by nurturing

forth coming generations while some others are in teaching professions, i.e. either school

teachers or serving in colleges. Some others are in different professions like lawyer,

journalist, officials in different organisations, etc. A few of them have also started their own

schools of music and dance. Some of them are also engaged in different NGOs in this locality

and thus serving the society.

They organized a impressive cultural programme. Some of them now are professional

singers and dancers. They devoted their valuable time in organizing it. Their spontaneity

had touched us. The Principal detivered inaugural speech and other teachers present there

also shared their observations asserting that the college is proud of its alumni. IQAC

emphasised on the participation of the Alumni for the all round enrichment of the college at

their best. The students' efficient performances and their recollection of the 'pastl revealed

their attachment with this coll€Be, with teachers and friends. They have highlighted their
experiences how they enjoyed their college days and also how the college had empowered
them to face the chaltenges in various spheres of life.

There was also arrangement of coffee and snacks and at the end of the programme there
was the arrangement of grand lunch.

Before completion of the programme they have announced that the next Reunion will be
cef ebrated on the second Sunday of January, 2020.
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Report

1" Reunion held on 13.0 !.zOLg

Under the initiative of IQAC the Alumni Association of Durgapur Women's College had been

formed on !5.12.2019. Accordingly it was decided that the portfolio holders of the
association would make earnest effort to disseminate this information among the Ex-

students and increase the membership as early as possible. lt was also resolved in the
meeting that a Reunion would be held on 13.01 .2019.

Within a short period, our ex-students very successfully organized the celebration. With
remarkable enthusiasm and due sincerity they celebrated their 1-'t reunion in their Alma

Mater. Approximately 50 students joined the celebration on that date. We were
overwhelmed to find our students, who had their graduation even in the 80s or early 90s, to
come and participate in the programme. Some of them came from Kolkata, while one of
them joined coming from Sikkim. This undoubtedly spelt their feeling for their college.

Of these students some are now housewives contributing a lot to the society by nurturing
forth coming generations while some others are in teaching professions, i.e. either school

teachers or serving in colleges. Some others are in different professions like lawyer,
journalist, officials in different organisations, etc. A few of them have also started their own
schools of music and dance. Some of them are also engaged in different NGOs in this locality
and thus serving the society.

They organized a impressive cultural programme. Some of them now are professional

singers and dancers. They devoted their valuable time in organizing it. Their spontaneity
had touched us. The Principal delivered inaugural speech and other teachers present there
also shared their observations asserting that the college is proud of its alumni. leAC
emphasised on the participation of the Alumni for the all round enrichment of the college at
their best. The students' efficient performances and their recollection of the 'past' revealed
their attachment with this coll€g€, with teachers and friends. They have highlighted their
experiences how they enjoyed their college days and also how the coltege had empowered
them to face the challenges in various spheres'of life.

There was also arrangement of coffee and snacks and at the end of the programme there
was the arrangement of grand lunch.

Before completion of the programme they have announced that the next Reunion will be
cefebrated on the second Sunday of January, 2020.
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